PROPOSAL SUBMITTAL FORM 2 - SAMPLE PRICE PROPOSAL FORM

PROPOSER IS REQUIRED TO DISCLOSE ANY EXCEPTIONS TO DEVICE REPAIRS AND/OR REPLACEMENTS FOR PURCHASED DEVICES AND/OR SERVICES, AND MUST CLEARLY SPECIFY ALL EXCEPTIONS AND LIST THE SEPARATE COSTS IN THE PROPOSER'S PRICING PROPOSAL

PROPOSERS MAY SUBMIT PROPOSALS FOR ONE, TWO OR ALL THREE CATEGORIES OF SERVICE, AND MAY BID ON ONE OR MORE PARTS OF AN INDIVIDUAL CATEGORY. HOWEVER, TO BE CONSIDERED FOR AN AWARD, PROPOSERS BIDDING ON PART A, B AND/OR C OF A SERVICE CATEGORY BELOW MUST INCLUDE PRICING FOR ALL LINE ITEMS LISTED IN SAID PART. COMPLETE PRICE PROPOSALS SUBMITTED FOR EACH PART WILL BE EVALUATED BASED ON THEIR TOTAL PRICING.

IF APPLICABLE, THE PERCENTAGE ESTABLISHED BY RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD FOR THE INVESTMENT IN THE PUERTO RICAN INDUSTRY SHALL BE IDENTIFIED BY PROPOSER IN A SEPARATE COLUMN IN THE PROPOSER'S PRICE PROPOSAL SO THAT THE EVALUATION OF PRICING TO BE CONDUCTED IN ACCORDANCE WITH LAW NO. 14 OF JANUARY 8, 2004, AS AMENDED.

CATEGORY 1: MOBILE DEVICES AND CARTS

PART A: LAPTOPS

ITEM	MODEL	QTY	PRICE	
LAPTOP	AVELMATE SPIN B118-G2-RN	20,000	\$469.00ea.	
CART	CSC36AC	620	\$995.00ea.	
ACCESSORIES	SEE TAB #3			
IMAGING AND ETCHING	SEE TAB #3	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	
MANAGED SERVICES (Configuration, asset tagging and warranty and non-warranty repairs)	SEE TAB #3	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	
TOTAL (MUST INCLUDE PRICING FOR ALL LINE ITEMS):			\$9,996,900.00	

PART B: TABLETS

ITEM	MODEL	QTY	PRICE	
TABLET		NO BID	NO BID	
CART				
ACCESSORIES				
IMAGING AND ETCHING				
MANAGED SERVICES (Configuration, asset tagging and warranty and non-warranty repairs)				
TOTAL (MUST INCLUDE PRICING FOR ALL LINE ITEMS):			NO BID	



Page | 67

CATEGORY 2: PROFESSIONAL DEVELOPMENT CURRICULUM INTEGRATION AND TECHNICAL TRAINING

PART A: LAPTOPS

ITEM	MODEL	QTY	PRICE
LAPTOP USE		NO BID	NO BID
INTEGRATION INTO CLASSROOM AND CURRICULUM			
TECHNICAL TRAINING FOR OSIATD, FIELD TECHNICIANS			
TOTAL (MUST INCLUDE PRICING FOR ALL LINE ITEMS):			\$0.00

PART B: TABLETS

ITEM	MODEL	QTY	PRICE
TABLET USE		NO BID	NO BID
INTEGRATION INTO CLASSROOM AND CURRICULUM			
TECHNICAL TRAINING FOR OSIATD, FIELD TECHNICIANS			
TOTAL (MUST INCLUDE PRICING FOR ALL LINE ITEMS):			\$0.00

CATEGORY 3: PROJECT MANAGEMENT

PART A: LOGISTICS AND DEVICE DISTRIBUTION

MODEL	QTY	PRICE
SEE TAB #3	1	\$35,000.00
SEE TAB #3	20,620	\$8.00 per device
		\$199,960.00 \$0.00
	SEE TAB #3	SEE TAB #3 1

PART B: TECHNICAL SUPPORT, HELP DESK AND TICKETING SYSTEM

ITEM	MODEL	QTY	PRICE
PICKUP AND TRANSPORT OF DEVICES FOR REPAIR	ANSPORT OF DEVICES FOR REPAIR NO BID		NO BID
HELP DESK SERVICES			
IMPLEMENTATON AND MANAGEMENT OF TICKETING SYSTEM			
TOTAL (MUST INCLUDE PRICING FOR ALL LINE ITEMS):			\$0.00

PART C: ASSET INVENTORY MANAGEMENT AND TRACING

ITEM	MODEL	QTY	PRICE
ASSET INVENTORY MANAGEMENT		NO BID	NO BID
DEVICE TRACKING			
TOTAL (MUST INCLUDE PRICING FOR ALL LINE ITEMS):			\$0.00

TOTAL PROPOSAL PRICING: \$10,196,860.00

TOTAL PROPOSAL PRICING FOR EVALUATION PURPOSES,
AFTER APPLICATION OF INVESTMENT PERCENTAGE:

\$10,196,860.00





PUERTO RICO DEPARTEMNT OF EDUCATION REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP) NO: PRDE-OSIATD-2018-002

MOBILE DEVICES, PROFESSIONAL DEVELOPMENT AND PROJECT MANAGEMENT

QUOTE:

DATE:

10/12/2018 2018-002

CUSTOMER#

PRDE

CATEGORY 1: MOBILE DEVICES AND CARTS

PART A: LAPTOPS

Qty	Manufacturer t	Description	Unit Price	Total Price
1 5-14,15		LAPTOPS		
20000	TMB118-RN	Acer TravelMate B118 laptop Computer	\$ 469.00	\$ 9,380,000.00
		Convertible notebook that allows the device to switch between laptop, tablet, and tent forms. Keyboard remains attached to the device at all times.		
		Attached full-size keyboard that should be able to flip around out of the way in tablet mode		
		Intel® Celeron® quad-core processor N4100 (4 MB L2 cache, 1.10 GHz, up to 2.4 GHz with Intel® Burst Technology, DDR4 or LPDDR4, 6W)		
		4GB DDR3L RAM Intel® UHD Graphics 600, supporting OpenGL® 4.4, OpenCLTM 1.2, Vulkan, Microsoft® DirectX® 12		
		128 GB SSD, SATA 6 Gb/s		
		Weight - 3.5 lbs		
		Wi-Fi – 802.11 ac Wi-Fi (802.11n 2.4GHz and 5GHz)		
		Miracast (Intel® Wireless Display) Compliant		
		Bluetooth – 4.0 wireless technology		
		Operating System – Windows 10 Education		
		Video conferencing HD webcam with: • 1280 x 720 resolution • 720p HD audio/video recording		
		Battery • 48 Wh 3220 mAh 15.2 V 4-cell Li ion battery pack Battery life: Up to 13 hours (based on MobileMark® 2014 test results) Power adapter 3-pin 45 W AC adapter: • 95 (W) x 38 (D) x 25.4 (H) mm (3.74 x 1.5 x 1.0 inches) • 150 g with 150 cm DC cable		
		Display - 11.6-inch diagonal with IPS (In-Plane Switching) technology, Full HD 1920 x 1080 resolution, high-brightness, LED-backlit TFT LCD with integrated multi-touch Wide viewing angle 16:9 aspect ratio Mercury free, environment friendly	te.	





PUERTO RICO DEPARTEMNT OF EDUCATION REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP) NO: PRDE-OSIATD-2018-002

MOBILE DEVICES, PROFESSIONAL DEVELOPMENT AND PROJECT MANAGEMENT

DATE: QUOTE:

10/12/2018 2018-002

CUSTOMER # PRDE

CATEGORY 1: MOBILE DEVICES AND CARTS PART A: LAPTOPS

Qty	Manufacturer /	Description	Unit Price	T	otal Price
		Two built-in stereo speakers (2w)			
	1	Input/output interfaces for video, keyboard, computer, audio			
	1	and capable of connecting to standard video output devices			
		such as digital projectors, smart boards, computer monitors,			
		and TVs (additional detail under "Ports and Print Service").			
		At minimum, the device includes the following ports:			
		2 USB (at least one of which is USB 3.0)			
		1 HDMI			
		1 3.5-mm stereo headphone mini-jack			
		1 RJ-45			
		Built-in microphone	7		
		3 years manufacturers warranty			
		CARTS			
620	CSC36AC	Tripplite 36-Device AC Charging Station Cart for	\$995.00	\$	616,900.0
		Charges 36 Chromebooks and laptops up to 15 in. screen size			
		The external construction must be made from welded 12 - 18-			
		gauge solid steel frame			
		The shelving must be 20-gauge steel or thicker			
		Slot size be at least 1.25" or more to accommodate current			
		PRDE issued student laptops and tablets with keyboards			
		Dividers must be consisting of shock absorbing ABS Plastic			
		or Nylon shelf divider system to prevent wear and tear on			
		devices			
		Cart width must not exceed 28" to fit through all classroom	`		
		doors and cart footprint should be as small as possible to take			
		up less space in the classroom (e.g. 28" x 28")			
		Electrical components must be UL listed and cart shall have a		_	
		switch located on the exterior of the cart to enable switching			
		off of power to the cart if necessary			
	 	·			
		Charging components shall deliver a sufficient number of			
		amps per device to allow for charging in the shortest period of			
		time without negatively affecting the electronics of the devices			
		Idevices			
		Must work with a standard 15 Amp electrical circuit. Smart			
		power management system that prevents circuit tripping and			
		protects devices by charging "round robin" style and is current			
		sensing (able to determine the changing needs of the			
	1	connected devices).			





PUERTO RICO DEPARTEMENT OF EDUCATION

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP) NO: PRDE-OSIATD-2018-002

MOBILE DEVICES, PROFESSIONAL DEVELOPMENT AND PROJECT MANAGEMENT

DATE:

10/12/2018

QUOTE: CUSTOMER# 2018-002 PRDE

CATEGORY 1: MOBILE DEVICES AND CARTS

PART A: LAPTOPS

	Cart must be constructed of steel or similar durable metal that		
	prevents exterior access to the contents without opening doors (no removable panels)		
	External LED to indicate charging status		
	Cart must have a cable management system to organize power adapters.		
	Carts must have lockable doors and must include everything needed to secure equipment, either through a metal hasp and padlock, and/or keyed locking handles; ideally with multipoint security (2 or 3 bolt locking system). If a padlock (keyed or combination) is required it must be included.		
	The casters must have oversized (4" - 6" diameter and at least 1" width) industrial grade balloon (solid rubber) tires with metal construction swivel castors capable of supporting 250+ lb. each). Non-marring rubber must provide easy rolling, quiet transport and be fully lockable.		
	Carts must adhere to UL's 10-degree tip threshold.		
	Carts must conform to common electrical and general safety standards (e.g. UL 60950, 1678, 1667, 498, etc.)		
	Full access double doors in the front for the user and in the rear for the IT Administrator.		
	Mostly unobstructed top work surface to accommodate peripherals such as printers or other devices.		
	Cart must also provide ventilation vents to ensure devices don't overheat while charging in cart.		
	3 years manufacturers warranty		
	IMAGING AND ETCHING SERVICES		
20000	Manufacturer Custom Image Installation	INCLUDED	
20000	Manufacturer Laser Etching Services	INCLUDED	
	MANAGED SERVICES		
	Warranty Repairs		
	Advanced Hardware Replacement	INCLUDED	





PUERTO RICO DEPARTEMENT OF EDUCATION

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP) NO: PRDE-OSIATD-2018-002

MOBILE DEVICES, PROFESSIONAL DEVELOPMENT AND PROJECT MANAGEMENT

DATE:

10/12/2018

QUOTE:

2018-002

CUSTOMER #:

PRDE

CATEGORY 3: PROJECT MANAGEMENT

PART A: LOGISTICS AND DEVICE DISTRIBUTION

Qty	Manufacturer #	Description	a Shift	Unit Price	T	otal Price
1		PROJECT MANAGEMENT AND DISTRIBUTIONS LOGISTICS	\$	35,000.00	\$	35,000.0
20620		PICKUP AND TRANSPORT OF NEW DEVICES FROM WAREHOUSES TO SCHOOLS	\$	8.00	\$	164,960.00
					100	
			Pr	oposal Total	\$	199,960.00

